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Rad Blagojevic

From: Rad Blagojevic

Sent:  Friday, 14 January 2011 9:16 AM

To: Rad Blagojevic

Subject: FW: (DWS Doc No 2958565) RE: 16 Kerr Road, Ingleburn - DA 1745/2010

From: Brent Winning [mailto:bmwinning@claron.com.au]

Sent: Thursday, 13 January 2011 8:48 AM

To: Rad Blagojevic

Subject: (DWS Doc No 2958565) RE: 16 Kerr Road, Ingleburn - DA 1745/2010

Rad,

My instructions in view of the Nustas Group’s failure are not to proceed further with the
application. It may be re-visited at a later stage depending on who buys the property (but in my
view this is unlikely).

Would you please refund any remainder of the fees paid to CLARON PROPERTY GROUP PTY
LTD.

Thanks for your help.

Kind regards,

Brent M Winning [8.8uild Hons.)., GDURP, CPP, MAIB, MPIA]
Certified Practising Planner, Chartered Builder & Development Consultant
Bus. 9651 6011 Mob 0418 24 27 38

bmwinning@claron.com.au

www.claron.com.au

ABN 41639 B4 S
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